

# HOW DO I REGISTER WITH OPENGOV?

MyEscambia.com

**Escambia County**  
FLORIDA

Go HERE for OLF-8 opportunities

## Free Paint!

Re-blended paint is available for free at the Perdido Landfill every Thursday from 8 a.m. - 3 p.m.

[Learn More](#)

Free Paint Day

- Adopted Budget
- County Commissioners
- County Ordinances
- County Projects
- Departments
- Environmental Code Enforcement
- Flood Info
- Inmate Lookup
- Maps
- Meetings
- Parks
- Pensacola Beach
- Permits / Contractors
- Road Conditions

# HOW DO I REGISTER WITH VENDOR REGISTRY?

MyEscambia.com

Scroll down to “Purchasing Office” and click.

**Escambia County**  
FLORIDA

## Office of Purchasing

[Purchase Orders](#)  
[Check Register](#)  
[Solicitations](#)  
[Insurance Requirements](#)  
[Purchasing Ordinance](#)  
**[Vendor Resources](#)**  
[Standard Contract Format](#)

**MyEscambia Home** / Office of Purchasing

### About

The role of the Purchasing Division is to assist county departments and divisions in acquiring goods, services, or construction. The office is generally the initial contact for agencies and contractors to acquire goods or services. The Purchasing Division oversees a purchasing process that assures impartial and equitable evaluation of bids and proposals from vendors and helps agencies to establish fair and reasonable contracts. In the event of a contract dispute or claim resolution, the division acts as mediator.

### Mission Statement

To provide efficient, responsive services that enhance our quality of life, to provide high quality goods and services to county departments and citizens in an efficient and effective manner, while maintaining the highest standards of ethical conduct and professionalism. This mission is achieved by ensuring transparency, fairness, and accountability in all procurement activities as we work to obtain the best value for taxpayers while promoting healthy competition, supporting local businesses, meeting common needs, and promoting a safe and healthy community.

### Contact

**Phone:** 850-595-4980  
**Fax:** 850-595-4805  
**Email:** [purchasing@myescambia.com](mailto:purchasing@myescambia.com)

[View Solicitations](#)  
[View Purchasing Calendar](#)  
[Register to be a Vendor](#)

- Office of Purchasing
  - Purchase Orders
  - Check Register
  - Solicitations
  - Insurance Requirements
  - Purchasing Ordinance
  - Vendor Resources**
  - Standard Contract Format



## Vendor Resources

- ▼ Office of Purchasing
  - Purchase Orders
  - Check Register
  - Solicitations
  - Insurance Requirements
  - Purchasing Ordinance
  - Vendor Resources**
  - Standard Contract Format

[MyEscambia Home](#) / [Office of Purchasing](#) / Vendor Resources



Escambia County encourages local, small, women and minority owned businesses to register as vendors with the county. Businesses registered in OpenGov have an immediate advantage to act on any advertised bid solicitations that fit the description of their business.

There is no cost to register as a vendor. Once you have registered, you will be able to monitor the online board or receive notifications for various contract jobs available for bidding.

If you have questions please contact purchasing at [purchasing@myescambia.com](mailto:purchasing@myescambia.com).

---


Some of the eligible goods and services which can be provided by certified vendors are listed

**OPENGOV**  
PROCUREMENT

**OPENGOV**  
PROCUREMENT

## Account Activation

Thank you for setting up your account!  
Please click the button below to activate your account.

 Activate

[← Go Back](#)

**OPENGOV**  
PROCUREMENT

## Account Information

**First Name**  
 ✖  
This field is required

**Last Name**

**Company Name**

**Company Phone Number**  
 Add Ext.

Outside the United States & Canada?

[< Previous](#) [Next >](#)

**OPENGOV**  
PROCUREMENT

Sign up with just an Email!  
*We'll send you an email to activate your account*

[Sign Up](#)

[Already have an account?](#)

By clicking "Sign Up" you agree to our [Terms and Privacy Policy](#).

**OPENGOV**  
PROCUREMENT

## Set Password

**New Password** [Show](#)

Enter password

12 characters minimum. Why so many characters? [?](#)

**Confirm Password**

Re-enter password

[< Previous](#) [Next >](#)

**OPENGOV**  
PROCUREMENT

## Welcome to OpenGov Procurement!


We are excited to have you join!  
Let's set-up your account

[Start »](#)


Show Tutorial



Find Proposals

 My Proposals

 Following

 All Proposals



No public-sector reviews

Create Your Supplier Profile

Powered by **PROCURATED**


## No proposals started yet!


Get started by searching for projects to bid on.  
Your list of proposals will then be displayed here.


Find Projects

Lyndsey Stevens

 Settings

 **Company Profile**

 Admin

 Log out

## Test

[Edit Profile](#)



★★★★★ No public-sector reviews

[Create Your Supplier Profile](#)

Powered by **PROCURATED**

### COMPANY INFORMATION [edit](#)

Website	N/A
Phone Number	(850) 595-4988
Address	N/A
State of Incorporation	N/A
Company Type	N/A
Company Description	None
Dun & Bradstreet Number (DUNS)	None
Employer Identification Number (EIN)	None

### CATEGORY CODES [edit](#)

NIGP Codes	None
NAICS Codes	None
UNSPSC Codes	None

### CERTIFICATIONS [edit](#)

Certified Small Business	No
Disabled Veteran Business Enterprise	No
LGBT Owned	No
Minority Business Enterprise	No
Native American Owned	No
US DOT Certified DBE	No
Veteran Owned	No
Woman Business Enterprise	No
Health Crisis Emergency Provider	No
Natural Disaster Emergency Provider	No
Other Emergency Provider	No
Disadvantaged Business Enterprise Certifications Not Applicable	No





Company Name\*

Test

State of Incorporation\*

Required

Address Line 1\*

Required

Address Line 2

Optional

City\*

Required

State\*

Required

Zip Code\*

Required

Outside the United States?

Use a Different Billing Address?

Phone Number\*

(850) 595-4998

[Add Ext.](#)

Outside the United States & Canada?

Fax Phone Number

Optional

[Add Ext.](#)

Outside the United States & Canada?

Company Type

Optional

Website

Optional

Employer Identification Number (EIN)

Optional

\*Enter 9 digit EIN number

Dun & Bradstreet Number (DUNS)

Optional

\*Enter 7 to 13 digit DUNS number

Company Description

Optional

Save

Company Information

Category Codes

Certifications

Documents

### Category Codes

Select the category codes that your company responds to

Categories [add](#)  
NIGP CODES  
*None selected*  
NAICS CODES  
*None selected*  
UNSPSC CODES  
*None selected*

Save

#### Select Categories ✕

Code Set: NIGP | Keyword Search: Search Categories...

<div style="display: flex; align-items: flex-start;"> <div style="margin-right: 10px;"></div> <div> <p><b>01 - Administrative, Financial, and Management Services</b></p> <p>04000, 05200, 05300, 05800, 09800</p> </div> <div style="margin-left: auto; text-align: right;"> <p><a href="#">Select All</a> &gt;</p> </div> </div>
<div style="display: flex; align-items: flex-start;"> <div style="margin-right: 10px;"></div> <div> <p><b>03 - Arts, Crafts, Entertainment, Theatre</b></p> <p>03700, 05000, 05200, 23200, 23300, 58000, 85500, 86000</p> </div> <div style="margin-left: auto; text-align: right;"> <p><a href="#">Select All</a> &gt;</p> </div> </div>
<div style="display: flex; align-items: flex-start;"> <div style="margin-right: 10px;"></div> <div> <p><b>05 - Building Equipment, Supplies, and Services</b></p> <p>00500, 01000, 13500, 15000, 15500, 22500, 20500, 44000, 54000, 57000, 63000, 63500, 66500, 77000</p> </div> <div style="margin-left: auto; text-align: right;"> <p><a href="#">Select All</a> &gt;</p> </div> </div>
<div style="display: flex; align-items: flex-start;"> <div style="margin-right: 10px;"></div> <div> <p><b>08 - Computers, Software, Supplies, and Services</b></p> <p>20400, 20600, 20700, 20800, 20900, 25000, 39500, 92000</p> </div> <div style="margin-left: auto; text-align: right;"> <p><a href="#">Select All</a> &gt;</p> </div> </div>
<div style="display: flex; align-items: flex-start;"> <div style="margin-right: 10px;"></div> <div> <p><b>16 - Maintenance and Repair of Equipment</b></p> <p>02800, 02900, 03100, 03400, 03600, 03800, 03900, 04000, 04100</p> </div> <div style="margin-left: auto; text-align: right;"> <p><a href="#">Select All</a> &gt;</p> </div> </div>
<div style="display: flex; align-items: flex-start;"> <div style="margin-right: 10px;"></div> <div> <p><b>22 - Public Works, Park Equipment, and Construction Services</b></p> <p>33500, 51500, 59500, 65000, 67500, 69000, 69100, 79000, 90900, 91000, 91200, 91300, 91400, 95900, 96800, 98800</p> </div> <div style="margin-left: auto; text-align: right;"> <p><a href="#">Select All</a> &gt;</p> </div> </div>

[Show all categories...](#)

Categories [edit](#)

NIGP CODES

- 05200 - Art Objects
- 05202 - Antiques
- 05208 - Ceramic and Glass Objects (Shadow Boxes, Stained Glass, etc.)
- 05214 - Cut-Outs, Life Size/Oversized, of Animals and Symbols
- 05216 - Drawings (Originals) (Charcoal Prints, etc.)

NAICS CODES

*None selected*

UNSPSC CODES

*None selected*



## Certifications

Indicate the certifications that your company holds.

Certified Small Business

### Certification Details

Expiration

Certifying agency, certificate number, etc

Enter the certifying agency and certificate number



Save

Disabled Veteran Business Enterprise

LGBT Owned

Minority Business Enterprise

Native American Owned

US DOT Certified DBE

Veteran Owned

Woman Business Enterprise

None of These Apply

## Emergency Provider Classifications <sup>?</sup>

If your company is an emergency provider, please indicate your emergency classifications.

Health Crisis Emergency Provider

Natural Disaster Emergency Provider

Other Emergency Provider

Show Tutorial



**OpenGov Procurement Portal**

List of open opportunities on the OpenGov Procurement Platform

NIGP

Search Categories...

[view categories](#)

**Search**

OpenGov Current Opportunities

	Project Title	Organization	Release Date	Due Date
	IRRIGATION PARTS AND SERVICE FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT <b>OPEN</b>	County of Ocean	4/5/2023	4/25/2023
	JAIL ELEVATORS REPLACEMENT J1 & J2 FOR OCEAN COUNTY <b>OPEN</b>	County of Ocean	3/15/2023	4/25/2023
	FURNISHING OF CONSULTANT SERVICES TO MAINTAIN NEW JERSEY STATE ASSOCIATION OF CHIEFS OF POLICE (NJSACOP) ACCREDITATION <b>OPEN</b>	Middlesex County	4/4/2023	4/25/2023
	GENERATOR UPGRADES AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS <b>OPEN</b>	County of Ocean	3/22/2023	4/25/2023
	EXTERMINATION/PEST CONTROL MANAGEMENT SERVICES <b>OPEN</b>	County of Ocean	4/5/2023	4/25/2023
	REPAIR SERVICE FOR VARIOUS VEHICLES UNDER 15,000 GVWR <b>OPEN</b>	County of Ocean	4/5/2023	4/25/2023
	ICE AND SNOW REMOVER <b>OPEN</b>	County of Ocean	4/5/2023	4/25/2023
	VEHICLE LIFT REPAIR AND SERVICE <b>OPEN</b>	County of Ocean	4/5/2023	4/25/2023
	RFQ 4593 of INVENTORY PARTS <b>OPEN</b>	Southwest Ohio Regional Transit Authority	4/24/2023	4/25/2023
	Erress Blvd Roadway and Drainage Improvements <b>OPEN</b>	Escambia County	3/21/2023	4/25/2023
	Boiler Inspection, Maintenance & Repair Services <b>OPEN</b>	Richland School District Two	3/31/2023	4/25/2023
	23C8 Walk-In Freezer and Refrigerator at Governor Thomas Johnson Middle School and Urbana High School <b>OPEN</b>	Frederick County Public Schools	3/31/2023	4/25/2023
	Sidewalk Replacements - Carol Drive and Jarvis Road Neighborhoods <b>OPEN</b>	Town of Manchester	4/4/2023	4/25/2023



## Office of Purchasing

[Purchase Orders](#)

[Check Register](#)

[Solicitations](#)

[Insurance Requirements](#)

[Purchasing Ordinance](#)

[Vendor Resources](#)

[Standard Contract  
Format](#)

[MyEscambia Home](#) / Office of Purchasing

### About

The role of the Purchasing Division is to assist county departments and divisions in acquiring goods, services, or construction. The office is generally the initial contact for agencies and contractors to acquire goods or services. The Purchasing Division oversees a purchasing process that assures impartial and equitable evaluation of bids and proposals from vendors and helps agencies to establish fair and reasonable contracts. In the event of a contract dispute or claim resolution, the division acts as mediator.

### Mission Statement

To provide efficient, responsive services that enhance our quality of life, to provide high quality goods and services to county departments and citizens in an efficient and effective manner, while maintaining the highest standards of ethical conduct and professionalism. This mission is achieved by ensuring transparency, fairness, and accountability in all procurement activities as we work to obtain the best value for taxpayers while promoting healthy competition, supporting local businesses, meeting common needs, and promoting a safe and healthy community.

### Contact

**Phone:** 850-595-4980

**Fax:** 850-595-4805

**Email:** [purchasing@myescambia.com](mailto:purchasing@myescambia.com)

[View Solicitations](#)

[View Purchasing Calendar](#)

[Register to be a Vendor](#)



Escambia County  
Pensacola, FL

All dates and times in Central Time

+ Subscribe

Questions?

Visit Help Center

Procurement Portal

Projects Calendar

All Departments

Active

Advanced Search

Project Title	Project ID	Addenda	Release Date	Due Date
Erress Blvd Roadway and Drainage Improvements <b>OPEN</b>	PD 22-23.062	2	3/21/2023	4/25/2023
S Chamstrand Road Drainage and Sidewalk Improvements <b>OPEN</b>	PD 22-23.065	4	3/24/2023	4/25/2023
NED Wheelchair Ramp - 8391 Western Way <b>OPEN</b>	NED-S-8391-041223-2	0	4/12/2023	4/28/2023
NED Wheelchair Ramp - 1000 S. Fairfield Drive #24 <b>OPEN</b>	NED-S-1000/24-041223	0	4/13/2023	4/28/2023
NED Wheelchair Ramp - 1000 S. Fairfield Drive #47 <b>OPEN</b>	NED-S-1000/47-041223	0	4/12/2023	4/28/2023
Demolition Vessel Removal, Transport & Disposal <b>OPEN</b>	MRD 04142023	0	4/14/2023	4/28/2023
CRA Roofing Project - 1912 Gary Cir <b>OPEN</b>	CRA-1912-041323	0	4/13/2023	4/27/2023
CRA Roofing Project - 3805 Kelly Ave <b>OPEN</b>	CRA-3805-041323	0	4/13/2023	4/27/2023
CRA Roofing Project - 2207 W. Jordan St <b>OPEN</b>	CRA-2207-041323	0	4/13/2023	4/27/2023
NED Home Re-pipe - 4535 Havre Way <b>OPEN</b>	NED-S-4535-041223	0	4/12/2023	4/27/2023
1209 W Bobe Street Plumbing Job <b>OPEN</b>	CRA_4-28-23_EP	0	4/19/2023	4/28/2023
Hurricane Sally Damages @ Escambia County Sheriff Administration Building <b>OPEN</b>	HS_ESCO Admin_LB	0	4/17/2023	5/1/2023
Lifeguard Tower <b>OPEN</b>	PD 22-23.071	1	4/4/2023	5/1/2023
ESCAMBIA COUNTY ENVIRONMENTAL ENFORCEMENT SOLICITATION FOR BIDS <b>OPEN</b>	EE1	0	4/20/2023	5/2/2023
NED - Home Rehab - 7272 Snow Rd <b>OPEN</b>	NED-S-7272-042423	0	4/26/2023	5/10/2023
Beach Haven Phase II Construction <b>OPEN</b>	PD 22-23.070	1	4/11/2023	5/12/2023
Phase II Broadband <b>OPEN</b>	PD 22-23.068	2	3/29/2023	12/28/2299



# S Chemstrand Road Drainage and Sidewalk Improvements

Last updated by Addendum #4 on Apr 20, 2023 2:28 PM

General Solicitation Purchasing

Project ID: PD 22-23.085

Release Date: Friday, March 24, 2023 : Due Date: Tuesday, April 25, 2023 2:00pm

Posted Thursday, March 30, 2023 3:00pm

All dates & times in Central Time

[Draft Response](#) [Events RSVP](#) [No Bid](#)

Time Remaining: 3 hours, 49 minutes

Follow



Project Documents

Downloads

Addenda & Notices

Question & Answer

Followers

- 1. Introduction
- 2. Project Details
- 3. Vendor Submissions
- 4. Attachments

[View All Sections](#)

To respond to this project, please click the "Draft Response" button above.

## Post Information

Posted At: Thu, Mar 30, 2023 3:00 PM  
 Sealed Bid Process: Yes (Bids Sealed / Pricing Sealed)  
 Private Bid: No

## 1. Introduction

### 1.1. Summary

Notice is hereby given that the Escambia County Board of County Commissioners will receive sealed bids for sidewalks and drainage improvements along S. Chemstrand Road, including connecting side roads, from 9 Mile Road to Johnson Ave. Sidewalks will be incorporated down the east and west side of Chemstrand and will include 3 bus stop pads. Existing drainage systems will be replaced and expanded to adequately convey stormwater for the drainage basin to the Kaylyn Road County Pond and/or the Johnson Ave. stormwater system.

### 1.2. Contact Information

Buzz Roggenbuck  
 Sr. Procurement Coordinator  
 213 S. Palafox Place  
 Pensacola, FL 32502-5822  
 Email: [abroggenbuck@myescambia.com](mailto:abroggenbuck@myescambia.com)  
 Phone: (850) 595-4878

Department:  
Purchasing

### 1.3. Timeline

Release Project Date: March 24, 2023  
 Pre-Bid Meeting (Mandatory): April 3, 2023, 3:00pm  
 COC Conference Room-205  
 3383 West Park Place  
 Pensacola FL  
 Question Submission Deadline: April 18, 2023, 3:00pm  
 Submission Deadline: April 25, 2023, 2:00pm



## S Chemstrand Road Drainage and Sidewalk Improvements

Last updated by Addendum #4 on Apr 20, 2023 2:28 PM

General Solicitation Purchasing

Project ID: PD 22-23.065

Release Date: Friday, March 24, 2023 · Due Date: Tuesday, April 25, 2023 2:00pm

Posted Thursday, March 30, 2023 3:00pm

All dates & times in Central Time

[Draft Response](#) [Events RSVP](#) [No Bid](#)

Time Remaining: 3 hours, 48 minutes

Follow



Project Documents

Downloads

Addenda & Notices

Question & Answer

Followers

### Project Documents Download

Select the documents you would like to download

[Select All](#)

#### Project Documents:

- PD\_22-23.065\_S\_Chemstrand\_Road\_Drainage\_and\_Sidewalk\_Improvements\_ITB.pdf  
Mar 30, 2023 2:58 PM
- PD\_22-23.065\_S\_Chemstrand\_Bid\_Plans\_3-2023.pdf  
Apr 5, 2023 12:21 PM
- PD\_22-23.065\_S\_Chemstrand\_Road\_Technical\_Specifications.pdf  
Apr 5, 2023 12:21 PM

#### Addenda:

- #1 PD 22-23.065 Addendum 1  
Mar 30, 2023 3:03 PM
- #2 PD 22-23.065 Addendum 2  
Apr 4, 2023 2:09 PM
- #3 PD 22-23.065 Addendum 3  
Apr 4, 2023 2:22 PM
- #4 PD 22-23.065 S. Chemstrand Road Drainage and Sidewalk Improvements Addendum 4  
Apr 20, 2023 2:27 PM

#### Official Notices:

- #2 PD 22-23.065 S Chemstrand Road Drainage Mandatory Pre-solicitation Attendance Sheet  
Apr 12, 2023 2:25 PM
- #2 PD 22-23.065 S Chemstrand Road Drainage Mandatory Pre-solicitation Attendance Sheet 2nd Meeting  
Apr 12, 2023 2:25 PM

[Download Selected Items](#)



## S Chemstrand Road Drainage and Sidewalk Improvements

Last updated by Addendum #4 on Apr 20, 2023 2:28 PM

General Solicitation Purchasing

Project ID: PD 22-23 085

Release Date: Friday, March 24, 2023 - Due Date: Tuesday, April 25, 2023 2:00pm

Posted Thursday, March 30, 2023 3:00pm

All dates & times in Central Time

[Draft Response](#) [Events RSVP](#) [No Bid](#)

Time Remaining: 3 hours, 47 minutes

Follow



Project Documents

Downloads

Addenda & Notices

Question & Answer

Followers

### Addenda & Official Notices

Addenda & Notices issued following the posting of the project

- All 5
- Addenda 4
- Notices 2

#### Addendum #1

Mar 30, 2023 3:03 PM

Addendum 1

[PD\\_22-23\\_085\\_Addendum\\_1.pdf](#)

#### Addendum #2

Apr 4, 2023 2:09 PM

Addendum 2 - Schedule second Pre-solicitation meeting. Attendance is Mandatory at this meeting or the meeting held on April 3, 2023. Last day for questions is April 18, 2023, 3:00 pm.

[PD\\_22-23\\_085\\_Addendum\\_2.pdf](#)

#### Addendum #3

Apr 4, 2023 2:22 PM

Addendum 3 indicating time for the second Pre-solicitation meeting is April 11, 2023, 1:00 PM to 2:00 pm CT TEAMS meeting.

[PD\\_22-23\\_085\\_Addendum\\_3.pdf](#)

#### Addendum #4

Apr 20, 2023 2:28 PM

Addendum 4 - Revise Substantial Completion timeline to 485 days.

[PD\\_22-23\\_085\\_S\\_Chemstrand\\_Road\\_Drainage\\_and\\_Sidewalk\\_Improvements\\_Addendum\\_4.pdf](#)

Visit Help Center



## S Chemstrand Road Drainage and Sidewalk Improvements

Last updated by Addendum #4 on Apr 20, 2023 2:28 PM

General Solicitation Purchasing

Project ID: PD 22-23.085

Release Date: Friday, March 24, 2023 · Due Date: Tuesday, April 25, 2023 2:00pm

Posted Thursday, March 30, 2023 3:00pm

All dates & times in Central Time

[Draft Response](#) [Events RSVP](#) [No Bid](#)

Time Remaining: 3 hours, 45 minutes

Project Documents

Downloads

Addenda & Notices

Question & Answer

### Question & Answer

Questions and clarifications about the project

The question submission deadline has passed. No more questions can be submitted.

#### 1. No subject Apr 4 2023 at 3:54 PM



Anonymous Apr 4 2023 at 3:54 PM  
User information is private

Are there plans available for this bid? I do not see anything uploaded



Apr 21 2023 at 11:14 AM

Escambia County

Plans are available on the OpenGov site.

#### 2. Bid Date Apr 7 2023 at 10:00 AM



Anonymous Apr 7 2023 at 10:00 AM  
User information is private

Since there was an issues with the pre-bid meeting, and the deadline for questions has been moved. Will the bid date be moved back a week to allow time to get responses fro



Apr 21 2023 at 11:17 AM

Escambia County

The Bid due date is April 25, 2023, no change.



Visit Help Center

Escambia County Portal



## S Chemstrand Road Drainage and Sidewalk Improvements

Last updated by Addendum #4 on Apr 20, 2023 2:28 PM

General Solicitation Purchasing

Project ID: PD 22-23.085

Release Date: Friday, March 24, 2023 - Due Date: Tuesday, April 25, 2023 2:00pm

Posted Thursday, March 30, 2023 3:00pm

All dates & times in Central Time

[Draft Response](#) [Events RSVP](#) [No Bid](#)

Time Remaining: 3 hours, 45 minutes

Follow



Project Documents

Downloads

Addenda & Notices

Question & Answer

Followers

### Followers List

List of the users who are following updates on this project

Export to CSV

Vendor	Contact	Designation	Proposal Submitted
C.W. Roberts Contracting, Inc.	Lance Holland lholland@cwcontracting.com 4375 McCoy Dr. Pensacola, FL 32503 (850) 433-3001	Prime	
CDG, Inc.	Taylor Griffin taylor.griffin@cdge.com 11 W. Court Square Andalusia, AL 36421 (334) 222-6431	None	
Central Pipe Rehab	Natalie Wyckoff nwyckoff@centralpiperehab.com 7900 BELFORT PKWY STE 100 JACKSONVILLE, FL 32256-6930 (904) 847-7783	None	
Chavers Construction, Inc.	Thomas Dueling thomas@chaversinc.com 801 Virecent Rd. Cantonment, FL 32533 (850) 754-0245	Prime	
Core & Main	Chris Black christopher.black@coreandmain.com (251) 443-1725	None	
Dodge Data And Analytics	Jayalashmi L jayalashmi@construction.com 4300 Beltway Ste 150 Arlington, TX 78010 (800) 393-8343	Sub	
Empire Builders Group	David Sanfilippo estimator@empirebuildersgroup.com (850) 554-2500	Prime	
Evans & Company, Inc.	Pamela Brunson pam@evansandcompanyinc.com	Sub	

## Contact Purchasing

[Purchasing@myescambia.com](mailto:Purchasing@myescambia.com)

(850) 595-4980

### Staff:

- ❖ Lyndsey Stevens- Interim Director of Purchasing
- ❖ Tina Arroyo-Directors Aid
- ❖ David Miller-Senior Purchasing Coordinator
- ❖ Angela Jones-Senior Purchasing Coordinator
- ❖ Buzz Roggenbuck-Purchasing Coordinator
- ❖ Aby Raymond-Purchasing Coordinator