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DELINEATORS, REFLECTORIZED
1 HIGH INTENSITY, 4 IN. X 4 IN., WHITE, NO. HI-4W 10 1.05 1.05 10 2.07 10 3.50 3.00 10 0.80 0.80 10 1.02 1.00
2 HIGH INTENSITY, 4 IN. X 4 IN., YELLOW, NO. HI-4Y 10 1.05 1.05 10 2.07 10 3.50 3.00 10 0.80 0.80 10 1.02 1.00
3 HIGH INTENSITY, 4 IN. X 8 IN., WHITE, NO. HI-4W 100 1.60 1.60 100 1.79 100 4.00 3.50 100 1.25 1.25 100 1.52 1.45
4 HIGH INTENSITY, 4 IN. X 8 IN., YELLOW, NO. HI-48Y 200 1.60 1.60 200 1.79 200 4.00 3.50 200 1.25 1.25 200 1.52 1.45
5 OBJECT MARKER SIGNS- LEFT, 12 IN. X 36 IN., NO. OM-3L 75 12.57 12.27 75 12.18 75 23.40 22.40 75 13.35 13.35 75 13.08 12.97
6 OBJECT MARKER SIGNS- RIGHT, 12 IN. X 36 IN., NO. OM-3R 75 12.57 12.27 75 12.18 75 23.40 22.40 5 13.35 13.35 75 13.08 12.97

POSTS, STEEL, STRAIGHT GREEN (FOR ROADWAY SIGNS) HOLES EVERY 1/2 IN. TO 1/4 
IN DOWN

7 12 FT., 2 LBS/ FT. 2000 14.67 2,000 17.19 n/c 2000 22.10 18.25 2000 NO BID NO BID 2000 16.46 15.47
8 12 FT. GALVINIZED 2 2000 18.80 2,000 21.70 n/c 2000 27.35 24.08 2000 NO BID NO BID 2000 23.54 22.14

CHEVRON BRACKETS
9 FOR SIGNS 12 IN. X 18 IN. AND 18 IN. X 24 IN., NO. CABI 10 19.50 19.20 10 32.79 n/c 10 10.50 10.00 10 NO BID NO BID 10 21.05 20.24

10 FOR SIGNS 18 IN. X 24 IN. AND 24 IN. X 30 IN., NO CAB2 10 21.50 21.15 10 39.86 n/c 10 10.50 10.00 10 NO BID NO BID 10 21.05 20.24
11 FOR SIGNS 24 IN. X 30 IN. AND 30 IN. X 36 IN., NO. CAB3 1 23.75 23.40 1 46.93 n/c 1 11.50 11.00 1 NO BID NO BID 1 24.50 24.50
12 INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK

SIGNS, REGULATORY, TRAFFIC, TYPE IV, 3M (SCOTCHLITE HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 
GRADE 3930), AVERY DENNISON (T-5900 AND T-6000 SERIES), AND NIPPON CARBIDE 
(CRYSTAL GRADE 92000 SERIES), MEETING THE UNIFORM TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICE 
SPECIFICATION

13 MOVEMENT SIGNS- ALIGNMENT TYPE, DO NOT PASS, 24 IN.X 30 IN., NO. R4-1 1 20.95 20.45 1 20.45 1 35.00 34.00 1 22.00 22.00 1 21.74 21.57
14 MOVEMENT SIGNS- ALIGNMENT TYPE, KEEP RIGHT, 24 IN. X 30 IN,. NO. R4-7A 25 20.95 20.45 25 20.45 25 35.00 34.00 25 22.00 22.00 25 21.74 21.57

15 MOVEMENT SIGNS- EXCLUSION TYPE, NO TRUCKS, SYMBOL, 24 IN. X 24 IN., NO. R5-2 50 17.19 16.80 50 16.36 50 29.20 28.20 50 17.60 17.60 50 18.36 18.21

16 MOVEMENT SIGNS- EXCLUSION TYPE, NO TRUCKS, WORDS, 24 IN. X 18 IN., NO. R5-2P 50 12.57 12.27 50 12.27 50 23.40 22.40 50 13.20 13.20 50 13.08 12.97
17 MOVEMENT SIGNS- EXCLUSION TYPE, DO NOT ENTER, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. R5-1 50 26.19 25.56 50 25.56 50 36.50 35.50 50 27.50 27.50 50 26.68 26.02
18 MOVEMENT SIGNS- EXCLUSION TYPE, WRONG WAY, 36 IN. X 24 IN., NO. R-5-1a 50 25.14 24.54 50 24.54 50 36.50 35.50 50 26.40 26.40 50 25.50 25.29

19
MOVEMENT SIGNS- EXCLUSION TYPE, NO PARKING, LEFT, WORDS AND ARROW, 18 IN X 
24 IN., NO. R7-1L 50 12.57 12.27 50 12.27 50 23.40 22.40 50 13.20 13.20 50 13.08 12.97

20
MOVEMENT SIGNS- EXCLUSION TYPE, NO PARKING, RIGHT, WORDS AND ARROW, 18 IN. 
X 24 IN., NO. R7-1R 50 12.57 12.27 50 12.27 50 23.40 22.40 50 13.20 13.20 50 13.08 12.97

21
MOVEMENT SIGNS- EXCLUSION TYPE, NO PARKING, BOTH WAYS, WORDS AND ARROW, 
18 IN. X 24 IN., NO. R7-1D 50 12.57 12.27 50 12.27 50 23.40 22.40 50 13.20 13.20 50 13.08 12.97

22 MOVEMENT SIGNS- ONE WAY TYPE, LEFT, 18 IN. X 24 IN., NO. R6-2L 10 12.57 12.27 10 12.27 10 23.40 22.40 10 13.20 13.20 10 13.08 12.97
23 MOVEMENT SIGNS- ONE WAY TYPE, RIGHT, 18 IN X 24 IN., NO. R6-2R 10 12.57 12.27 10 12.27 10 23.40 22.40 10 13.20 13.20 10 13.08 12.97
24 MOVEMENT SIGNS- ONE WAY TYPE, LEFT, 36 IN X 12 IN., NO. R6-IL 10 12.57 12.27 10 12.27 10 23.40 22.40 10 13.20 13.20 10 13.08 12.97
25 MOVEMENT SIGNS- ONE WAY TYPE, RIGHT, 36 IN. X 12 IN., NO. R6-1R 10 12.57 12.27 10 12.27 10 23.40 22.40 10 13.20 13.20 10 13.08 12.97

26 MOVEMENT SIGNS- TURNING TYPE, NO RIGHT TURN, SYMBOL, 24 IN. X 24 IN., NO. R3-1 10 17.19 16.80 10 16.36 10 29.20 28.20 10 18.60 18.60 10 18.36 18.21

27 MOVEMENT SIGNS- TURNING TYPE, NO LEFT TURN, SYMBOL, 24 IN. X 24 IN., NO. R3-2 10 17.19 16.80 10 16.36 10 29.20 28.20 10 18.60 18.60 10 18.36 18.21
28 MOVEMENT SIGNS- TURNING TYPE, NO TURNS, WORDS, 24 IN. X 24 IN., NO. R3-3 10 16.76 16.36 10 16.36 10 29.20 28.20 10 17.60 17.60 10 17.44 17.30

29 MOVEMENT SIGNS- TURNING TYPE, NO "U" TURN, SYMBOLS, 24 IN. X 24 IN., NO. R3-4 10 17.19 16.80 10 16.36 10 29.20 28.20 10 18.60 18.60 10 18.36 18.21
30 MOVEMENT SIGNS- TURNIN GTYPE, RIGHT LANE RIGHT, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. R3-7R 1 26.19 25.56 1 25.56 1 42.25 41.25 1 27.50 27.50 1 26.68 26.02
31 MOVEMENT SIGNS- TURNING TYPE, LEFT LANE LEFT, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. R3-7L 1 26.19 25.56 1 25.56 1 42.25 41.25 1 27.50 27.50 1 26.68 26.02

32 MOVEMENT SIGNS- TURNING TYPE, MANDATORY LEFT ONLY, 30 IN. X 36 IN., NO. R3-5L 1 31.43 30.68 1 30.68 1 49.50 48.50 1 33.00 33.00 1 32.02 31.22

33 MOVEMENT SIGNS- TURNING TYPE, MANDATORY RIGHT ONLY, 30 IN. X 36 IN., NO. R3-5R 1 31.43 30.68 1 30.68 1 49.50 48.50 1 33.00 33.00 1 32.02 31.22

34
MOVEMENT SIGNS- TURNING TYPE, MANDATORY STRAIGHT ONLY, 30 IN. X 36 IN., NO. 
R3-5S 1 31.43 30.68 1 30.68 1 49.50 48.50 1 33.00 33.00 1 32.02 31.22

35
MOVEMENT SIGNS- TURNING TYPE, MANDATORY LEFT OR STRAIGHT ONLY, 30 IN. X 36 
IN., NO R3-6L 1 31.43 30.68 1 30.68 1 49.50 48.50 1 33.00 33.00 1 32.02 31.22

36
MOVEMENT SIGNS- TURNING TYPE, MANDATORY RIGHT OR STRAIGHT ONLY, 30 IN. X 36 
IN., NO. R3-6R 1 31.43 30.68 1 30.68 1 49.50 48.50 1 33.00 33.00 1 32.02 31.22

37 LEFT BLANK INTENTIONALLY
38 RIGHT-OF-WAY SIGNS- STOP ALL WAY, 18 IN. X 6 IN., NO. R1-4 1 3.53 3.47 1 3.07 1 7.40 6.90 1 3.50 3.50 1 4.33 4.20
39 RIGHT-OF-WAY SIGNS- STOP, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. R1-1 1200 24.25 23.74 1,200 24.86 31.50 30.50 1200 26.88 26.88 1200 25.96 25.77
40 RIGHT-OF-WAY SIGNS- STOP, 36 IN. X 36 IN., NO. R1-1 100 34.80 34.06 100 36.11 100 56.00 55.00 100 38.70 38.70 100 36.92 36.65
41 RIGHT-OF-WAY SIGNS- STOP, 48 IN  X 48 IN., NO. R1-1 1 61.30 60.02 1 64.74 1 104.80 102.10 1 68.80 68.80 1 65.64 65.21
42 RIGHT-OF-WAY SIGNS- YIELD, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. R1-2 1 12.96 12.69 1 14.58 1 25.50 24.50 1 13.59 13.59 1 13.74 13.61
43 RIGHT-OF-WAY- SIGNS- YIELD, 36IN. X 36 IN.,  NO. R1-2 200 16.99 16.61 200 19.45 200 25.50 24.50 200 19.58 19.58 200 17.50 17.35
44 SPEED SIGNS- 24 IN. X 30 IN., SPEED LIMIT 5, NO. R2-1-5 1 20.95 20.45 1 20.45 1 35.10 34.00 1 22.00 22.00 1 21.74 21.57
45 SPEED SIGNS- 24 IN. X 30 IN., SPEED LIMIT 10, NO. R2-1-10 1 20.95 20.45 1 20.45 1 35.00 34.00 1 22.00 22.00 1 21.74 21.57
46 SPEED SIGNS- 24 IN. X 30 IN., SPEED LIMIT 15, NO. R2-1-15 1 20.95 20.45 1 20.45 1 35.00 34.00 1 22.00 22.00 1 21.74 21.57
47 SPEED SIGNS- 24 IN. X 30 IN., SPEED LIMIT 20, NO. R2-1-20 100 20.95 20.45 100 20.45 100 35.00 34.00 100 22.00 22.00 100 21.74 21.57
48 SPEED SIGNS- 24 IN. X 30 IN., SPEED LIMIT 25, NO. R2-1-25 300 20.95 20.45 300 20.45 300 35.00 34.00 300 22.00 22.00 300 21.74 21.57
49 SPEED SIGNS- 24 IN. X 30 IN., SPEED LIMIT 30, NO. R2-1-30 300 20.95 20.45 300 20.45 300 35.00 34.00 300 22.00 22.00 300 21.74 21.57
50 SPEED SIGNS- 24 IN. X 30 IN., SPEED LIMIT 35 NO. R2-1-35 200 20.95 20.45 200 20.45 200 35.00 34.00 200 22.00 22.00 200 21.74 21.57
51 SPEED SIGNS- 24 IN. X 30 IN., SPEED LIMIT 40, NO. R2-1-40 100 20.95 20.45 100 20.45 100 35.00 34.00 100 22.00 22.00 100 21.74 21.57
52 SPEED SIGNS- 24 IN. X 30 IN., SPEED LIMIT 45, NO. R2-1-45 200 20.95 20.45 200 20.45 200 35.00 34.00 200 22.00 22.00 200 21.74 21.57
53 SPEED SIGNS- 24 IN. X 30 IN., SPEED LIMIT 50, NO. R2-1-50 50 20.95 20.45 50 20.45 50 35.00 34.00 50 22.00 22.00 50 21.74 21.57
54 SPEED SIGNS- 24 IN. X 30 IN., SPEED LIMIT 55, NO. R2-1-55 50 20.95 20.45 50 20.45 50 35.00 34.00 50 22.00 22.00 50 21.74 21.57
55 SPEED SIGNS- 24 IN. X 30 IN., LIMIT BLANK, NO. R2-1-B 1 20.95 20.45 1 20.45 1 35.00 34.00 1 22.00 22.00 1 21.74 21.57
56 SPEED SIGNS-30 IN. X 30 IN., REDUCED SPEED AHEAD, NO. W3-5A 50 26.19 25.56 50 25.56 50 42.25 41.25 50 30.63 30.63 50 32.46 32.42

57 WEIGHT LIMIT SIGNS- 24 IN. X 30 IN., NO. R12-1B 200 20..95 20.45 200 20.45 200 35.00 34.00 200 22.00 22.00 200 22.51 22.33
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SIGNS, WARNING, TRAFFIC, TYPE IV, 3M (SCOTCHLITE HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 
GRADE 3930), A VERY DENNISON (T-5900 AND T-6000 SERIES), AND NIPPON CARBIDE 
(CRYSTAL GRADE 92000 SERIES), MEETING THE UNIFORM TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICE 
SPECIFICATION

58 ADVANCED CROSSING SIGNS- HORSE CROSSING, SYMBOL, 30 IN. X 30 IN., W11-7 1 26.19 25.56 1 25.56 1 42.25 41.25 1 27.50 27.50 1 26.68 26.02

59 ADVANCED CROSSING SIGNS- TRUCK CROSSSING, WORDS, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W8-6 25 26.19 25.56 25 25.56 25 42.25 41.25 25 27.50 27.50 25 26.68 26.02
60 ADVANCE CROSSING SIGNS- FIRE STATION, SYMBOL, 30 IN. X 30 IN., W11-8 25 26.19 25.56 25 25.56 25 42.25 41.25 25 27.50 27.50 25 26.68 26.02
61 ADVANCED CROSSING SIGNS- FIRE STATION, SYMBOL, 36 IN. X 36 IN., NO. W11-8 1 37.71 36.81 1 36.81 1 58.20 57.20 1 39.40 39.40 1 38.06 37.74
62 ADVANCED CROSSING SIGNS- HANDICAPPED, SYMBOL, 36 IN. X 36 IN., NO. W11-9 1 37.71 36.81 1 36.81 1 58.20 57.20 1 39.40 39.40 1 68.06 37.74
63 ADVANCE CROSSING SIGNS- TRUCKS, SYMBOL, 36 IN. X 36 IN., NO. W11-10 10 37.71 36.81 10 36.81 10 58.20 57.20 10 39.40 39.40 10 38.06 37.74
64 ADVANCE CROSSING SIGNS- FIRE STATION, WORDS, 24 IN. X 18 IN., NO. W11-8P 1 12.57 12.27 1 12.27 1 23.40 22.40 1 13.20 13.20 1 13.08 12.97
65 ADVANCE CROSSING SIGNS- RAILROAD, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W10-1 100 24.32 23.73 100 23.58 100 42.25 41.25 100 27.50 27.50 100 26.68 26.02
66 ADVANCE CROSSING SIGNS-RAILROAD, 36 IN. X 36 IN., NO. W10-1 1 34.19 33.50 1 32.42 1 58.20 57.20 1 39.40 39.40 1 38.06 37.74
67 ADVANCE CROSSING SIGNS- RAILROAD, RIGHT, 36 IN. X 36 IN., NO W10-2R 1 37.71 36.81 1 36.81 1 58.20 57.20 1 39.40 39.40 1 38.06 37.74
68 ADVANCE CROSSING SIGNS- RAILROAD, RIGHT 36 IN. X 36 IN., NO. W10-3R 1 37.71 36.81 1 36.81 1 58.20 57.20 1 39.40 39.40 1 38.06 37.74
69 ADVANCE CROSSING SIGNS- RAILROAD, RIGHT, 36 IN. X 36 IN., NO. W10-4R 1 37.71 36.81 1 36.81 1 58.20 57.20 1 39.40 39.40 1 38.06 37.74
70 ADVISORY SPEED- 10 MPH, W/ BORDER, 24 IN. X 24 IN., NO. W13-1-10 1 16.76 16.36 1 16.36 1 29.20 28.20 1 17.60 17.60 1 17.44 17.30
71 ADVISORY SPED PLATE- 15 MPH, W/ BORDER, 24 IN. X 24 IN., NO. W13-1-15 1 16.76 16.36 1 16.36 1 29.20 28.20 1 17.60 17.60 1 17.44 17.30
72 ADVISORY SPEED- 20 MPH, W/ BORDER, 24 IN. X 24 IN., NO. W13-1-20 1 16.76 16.36 1 16.36 1 29.20 28.20 1 17.60 17.60 1 17.44 17.30
73 ADVISORY SPEED- 25 MPH, W/ BORDER, 24 IN. X 24 IN., NO. W13-1-25 1 16.76 16.36 1 16.36 1 29.20 28.20 1 17.60 17.60 1 17.44 17.30
74 ADVISORY SPEED- 30 MPH, W/ BORDER, 24 IN. X 24 IN., NO. W13-1-30 1 16.76 16.36 1 16.36 1 29.20 28.20 1 17.60 17.60 1 17.44 17.30
75 ARROW SIGN- SIGNLE ARROW, 48 IN. X 24 IN., NO. W1-6 100 33.52 32.72 100 32.72 100 52.40 51.40 100 35.00 35.00 100 34.15 33.30
76 ARROW SIGN-DOUBLE ARROW, 48 IN. X 24 IN., NO. W1-7 100 33.52 32.72 100 32.72 100 52.40 51.40 100 35.00 35.00 100 34.15 33.30
77 BUMP SIGNS- SYMBOL, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W8-1 200 26.19 25.56 200 25.56 200 42.25 41.25 200 27.50 27.50 200 26.68 26.02
78 DIP SIGNS- WORDS, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W8-2 100 26.19 25.56 100 25.56 100 42.25 41.25 100 27.50 27.50 100 26.68 26.02
79 CHEBRON ALIGHMENT SIGNS- 18 IN.X 24 IN., NO. W1-8 100 12.57 12.27 100 12.27 100 23.40 22.40 100 13.20 13.20 100 13.08 12.97
80 CHURCH SIGNS- WORD, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W39-3 10 26.19 25.56 10 25.56 10 42.25 41.25 10 27.50 27.50 10 26.68 26.02
81 CROSS ROAD SIGNS- SYMBOL, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W2-1 10 26.19 25.56 10 25.56 40 42.25 41.25 10 27.50 27.50 10 26.68 26.02
82 CROSS SIGNS- PEDIESTRIAN SYMBOL, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W11-A2 25 26.19 25.56 25 25.56 25 42.25 41.25 25 27.50 27.50 25 26.68 26.02
83 CURBE SIGNS- LEFT, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W1-2L 100 26.19 25.56 100 25.56 100 42.25 41.25 100 27.50 27.50 100 26.68 26.02
84 CURVE SIGNS- RIGHT, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W1-2R 100 26.19 25.56 1,000 25.56 100 42.25 41.25 100 27.50 27.50 100 26.68 26.02
85 DEAD END SIGN- WORDS & ARROW, LEFT, 36 IN. X 9 IN, NO. W14-1PL 1 11.80 11.60 1 9.20 1 23.40 22.40 1 9.90 9.90 1 10.39 10.31
86 DEAD END SIGN- WORDS & ARROW, RIGHT, 36 IN. X 9 IN., NO. W14-1PR 1 11.80 11.60 1 9.20 1 23.40 22.40 1 9.90 9.90 1 10.39 10.31
87 DEAD END SIGN- WORDS, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W14-1 400 26.19 25.56 400 25.56 400 42.25 41.25 400 27.50 27.50 400 26.68 26.02
88 NOT A  THROUGH STREET SIGN- WORDS, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W14-1a 10 26.19 25.59 10 25.56 10 42.25 41.25 10 27.50 27.50 10 26.68 26.02
89 NO OUTLET- WORDS, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W14-2 400 26.19 25.59 400 25.56 400 42.25 41.25 400 27.50 27.50 400 26.68 26.02
90 DIVIDED HIGHWAY SIGNS, 36 IN. X 36 IN., NO. W6-1 1 37.71 36.81 1 36.81 1 58.10 57.10 1 39.40 39.40 1 38.06 37.74
91 ONE LANE BRIDGE SIGNS- WORDS, 36 IN. X 36 IN., NO. W5-3 1 37.71 36.81 1 36.81 1 58.20 57.10 1 39.40 39.40 1 38.06 37.74
92 PAVEMENT ENDS SIGNS-WORDS, 36 IN. X 36 IN.,  NO. W8-3 10 37.71 36.81 10 36.81 10 58.20 57.20 10 39.40 39.40 10 38.06 37.74
93 PLAYGROUND SIGNS- WORDS, 36 IN. X 36 IN., NO W15-1 25 37.71 36.81 25 36.81 25 58.20 57.20 25 39.40 39.40 25 38.06 37.74
94 DEAF CHILD SIGN (WITHOUT "AREA") - WORDS, 36 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W41-4D 25 26.19 25.59 25 30.68 25 49.50 48.50 25 33.00 33.00 25 32.02 31.22
95 TRAFFIC MERGE SIGNS- RIGHT, 30 IN. 30 IN., NO. W4-1R 1 26.19 25.59 1 25.56 1 42.25 41.25 1 27.50 27.50 1 26.68 26.02
96 REVERSE CURVE SIGNS- LEFT, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W1-4L 50 26.19 25.59 50 25.56 50 42.25 41.25 50 27.50 27.50 50 26.68 26.02
97 REVERSE TURN SIGNS- LEFT, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W1-4R 50 26.19 25.59 50 25.56 50 42.25 41.25 50 27.50 27.50 50 26.68 26.02
98 REVERSE TURN SIGNS- LEFT, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W1-3L 50 26.19 25.59 50 25.56 50 42.25 41.25 50 27.50 27.50 50 26.68 26.02
99 REVERSE TURN SIGNS- RIGHT, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W1-3R 50 26.19 25.59 50 25.56 50 42.25 41.25 50 27.50 27.50 50 26.68 26.02

100 SIDE ROAD SIGNS- RIGHT, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W2-2R 10 26.19 25.59 10 25.56 10 42.25 41.25 10 27.50 27.50 10 26.68 26.02
101 SIDE ROAD SIGNS- LEFT, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W2-3L 10 26.19 25.59 10 25.56 10 42.25 41.25 10 27.50 27.50 10 26.68 26.02
102 SIDE ROAD SIGNS- RIGHT, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W2-3R 10 26.19 25.59 10 25.56 10 42.25 41.25 10 27.50 27.50 10 26.68 26.02
103 SIGNAL AHEAD SIGNS- SYMBOL, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W3-3 10 27.49 26.87 10 29.06 10 42.25 41.25 10 27.50 27.50 10 32.46 32.42
104 SIGNAL AHEAD SIGNS- SYMBOL, 36 IN. X 36 IN., NO. W3-3 1 39.01 38.12 1 40.31 1 49.50 48.50 1 39.40 39.40 1 46.27 46.24
105 SIGNAL AHEAD SIGNS- WORDS, 24 IN. X 18., NO. W3-3P 10 12.57 12.27 10 12.27 10 23.40 22.40 10 13.20 13.20 10 13.08 12.97
106 SLIPPERY WHEN WET SIGNS- SYMBOL, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W8-5 10 26.19 25.59 10 25.56 10 42.25 41.25 10 27.50 27.50 10 26.68 26.02
107 STOP AHEAD SIGNS- SYMBOL, 36 IN. X 36 IN., NO. W3-1A 100 39.01 38.12 100 40.31 100 49.50 48.50 100 44.00 44.00 100 46.27 46.24
108 STOP AHEAD SIGNS- WORDS, 24 IN. X 18 IN., NO. W3-1aP 1 12.57 12.27 1 12.27 1 23.40 22.40 1 13.20 13.20 1 13.08 12.97
109 T SYMBOL SIGNS- SYMBOL, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO W2-4 10 26.19 25.56 10 25.56 10 42.25 41.25 10 27.50 27.50 10 26.68 26.02
110 TURN SIGNS- LEFT, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W1-1L 100 26.19 25.56 100 25.56 100 4.25 41.25 100 27.50 27.50 100 26.68 26.02
111 TURN SIGNS- RIGHT, 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W1-1R 100 26.19 25.56 100 25.56 100 42.20 41.25 100 27.50 27.50 100 26.68 26.02
112 Y SYMBOL SIGNS- 30 IN. X 30 IN., NO. W2-5 10 26.19 25.56 10 25.56 10 42.25 41.25 10 27.50 27.50 10 26.68 26.02
113 YIELD AHEAD SIGNS- SYMBOL, 36 IN. X 36 IN., NO. W3-2A 25 39.01 38.12 25 40.31 25 49.50 48.50 25 44.00 44.00 25 46.27 46.24
114 YIELD AHEAD SIGNS- WORDS, 24 IN. X 18 IN., NO. W3-2aP 1 12.57 12.27 1 12.27 1 23.40 22.40 1 13.20 13.20 1 13.08 12.97

SIGNS, WARNING, TRAFFIC, TYPE IV, 3M (SCOTCHLITE HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 
GRADE 3930), A VERY DENNISON (T-5900 AND T-6000 SERIES), AND NIPPON CARBIDE 
(CRYSTAL GRADE 92000 SERIES), MEETING THE UNIFORM TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICE 
SPECIFICATION

115 CHEVRON ALIGNMENT SIGNS- 18 IN. X 24 IN., NO. W1-8 100 12.57 12.27 115 12.27 100 23.60 22.40 100 13.20 13.20 100 13.08 12.97
116 M1-6 MARKERS, 24 IN. X 24 IN. 100 18.22 17.93 100 16.36 100 29.20 28.20 100 18.60 18.60 100 22.56 22.41
117 ROUTE MARKER ARROWS, 15 IN. X 21 IN. 50 9.40 9.20 50 8.96 50 17.65 16.65 50 9.63 9.63 50 10.10 10.03
118 EOR-18RR DELINEATORS, 18 IN. X 18 IN. 100 14.40 14.20 100 9.20 100 18.05 17.05 100 12.00 12.00 100 18.03 17.94
119 OMI-1844 DELINEATORS, 18 IN. X 18 IN. 200 14.40 14.20 200 9.20 200 18.05 17.05 200 12.00 12.00 200 18.03 17.94
120 R 2-1-25 SPEED LIMIT, 18 IN. X 24 IN. 100 12.57 12.27 100 12.27 100 23.40 22.40 100 13.20 13.20 100 13.08 12.97

FLORESCENT HI-INT YELLOW GREEN SCHOOL SIGNS
121 S1-1 SCHOOL ZONE, 30 IN. X 30 IN. 100 44.60 44.13 100 35.25 100 66.00 65.00 100 43.13 43.13 100 47.96 47.40
122 S3-1 SCHOOL BUS STOP AHEAD, 30 IN. X 30 IN. 100 46.73 46.11 100 42.31 100 66.00 65.00 100 43.13 43.13 100 47.96 47.40
123 W 16-7 DIRECTIONAL ARROW, 12 IN. X 24 IN. 100 15.00 14.80 100 13.54 100 30.00 25.00 100 13.80 13.80 100 16.06 15.98
124 W 16-9P AHEAD PLACARD, 12 IN. X 24 IN. 10 15.00 14.80 100 13.54 100 26.00 25.00 100 13.80 13.80 100 16.06 15.98
125 W13-1-10 ADVISORY PLATE, 18 IN. X 18 IN. 50 17.10 16.88 50 15.23 50 28.50 27.50 50 15.55 15.55 50 18.05 18.01
126 W13-1-15 ADVISORY PLATE, 18 IN. X 18 IN. 50 17.10 16.88 50 15.23 50 28.50 27.50 50 15.55 15.55 50 18.05 18.01
127 W13-1-20 ADVISORY PLATE, 18 IN. X 18 IN. 150 17.10 16.88 150 15.23 150 28.50 27.50 150 15.55 15.55 150 18.05 18.01

                                             BID TOTALS $  2,827.66 2,752.21$     2,676.69$     -$   4,501.10$      4,406.93$       2,879.72$   2,879.72$    3,013.48$   2,939.96$    

*NOTE 1). PRICES FOR ALL SIGNS ARE 
BASED ON 3M #3930 HIGH INTENSITY 

PRISMATIC WITH THE EXCEPTION OF THE 
SCHOOL SIGNS. SCHOOL SIGN PRICES ARE 

BASED ON 3M $4083 DIAMOND GRADE 
CUBE, FLOURESCENT YELLOW GREEEN.    

2).  SHIPPING; STOCK ITEMS: 3-5 DAYS ARO 
NON STOCK ITEMS 30 45 DAYS ARO POSTS



NON STOCK ITEMS: 30-45 DAYS ARO POSTS: 
30-45 DAYS ARO








